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FROM THE 
EDITORIAL 
OFFICE 

The Editorial Board thanks Tracy Isaacs for her time spent on 
the editorial board and welcomes to the board Ori Simchen and 
Ingo Brigandt. The Board also wishes to thank Michael Stingl 
for his outstanding service as Editorial Board Coordinator and 
welcomes David Hunter as its new coordinator. 

The Editorial Board also wishes to thank the University of 
Calgary Press for its extraordinary partnership since the jour­
nal's inception. A special thanks is due to Judy Powell and 
John King at the University of Calgary Press and to our printer 
Herb Ratsch at Art Design Printing Inc.. Their leadership 
has helped make the Canadian Journal of Philosophy one of the 
premiere general interest academic philosophy journals in the 
world. Starting in 2013, the Canadian Journal of Philosophy will 
be published in partnership with Routledge, part of the Taylor 
& Francis Group. 

Most papers received by CJP are sent anonymously to two 
expert external referees. When papers are sent to referees, the 
Journal aims at a six-month response time for the author. For 
papers not sent for external review, the Journal aims at a three-
month response time for authors. 

All papers are given an initial anonymous review in the edito­
rial office. Promising papers are sent to an editor in their area, 
who may then send them (anonymously) to two referees. 
Papers with two strong referees' reports and the endorsement 
of the editor are sent to the editorial board as a whole, still 
anonymously, for discussion and a vote on acceptance. 

Because of the number of papers it receives, CJP is normally 
able to consider papers of no longer than 10,000 words. Longer 
papers may be returned to authors with a suggestion to shorten 
them or to submit them elsewhere. 

Online submissions will soon be possible at our Routledge 
website: www.tandfonline.com/loi/rcjp20. In the meantime, 
submissions should be sent to the Executive Secretary at 
q'p@uleth.ca. 
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