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found that delayed recovery at six weeks was
associatedwith psychologicalvulnerabilityin
patientswho had had influenza,White et al (in
press)foundthatonlypatientswithglandularfever,
but not otherviralinfectionswere associatedwith
fatigueatsixmonths followup.Wesselyetal(l995)
in a large prospective study, found no evidence that
common infections were related to the development
ofCFS inprimarycare.
Second,Shanks& Ho-Yen claimedthatcounsel

ling resulted in an 80% improvement rate. While
thisresultisveryimpressivetheauthorsfailedto
provide any data which supports their sweeping
conclusion. As one of the defining characteristics of
CFS (Sharpe et al, 1991) is a 50% reduction in
activitylevelsitisdifficultto seehow 80% of the
groupstudiedcouldhaveimprovedintermsoftheir
disabilitywhen theyweregivenadvicetolivewithin
their limits.
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of thesymptoms of fatigue.The detailedfindings
relatedtopsychiatricdiagnosiswerenotincludedin
our paper, but in this early onset population gener
alised anxiety and panic disorders were much more
frequently identified than the chronic depressive
states described in populations with a longer dur
ation of fatigue, and constituted over half the case
diagnoses.
Patientswithmore recentonsetofsymptoms and

a differentpatternofassociatedemotionaldisorder
appear to have a better prognosis. Admittedly this
fInding is based on a global clinical severity scale
and simple data about occupation, although at the
time the study was planned, more sophisticated
assessmentsof fatiguesymptomatology had not
been developed.
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Blu-Tack â€”¿�a novelsubstanceof abuse

M.F. SHANKS

Sm: We wish to report a novel form of substance
abuse, namely the smoking of the adhesive material
Blu-Tack. Three male patients (aged 23, 27 and 32
years) detained on our semi-secure unit for the
chronic mentally ill, all with the diagnoses of para
noid schizophrenia and substance abuse, were
found to have been attempting this activity in the
enforced absence of their preferred substances.

Two methods were employed. Both commenced
with drying the Blu-Tack on a radiator for three
weeks (or until the experimenter's patience expired).
The resulting residue was then either crumbled
and smoked withtobaccoina roll-upcigarette,or
inhaled from the burning end of a match. One of
thethreeinformedus thathe experienceda very
slight â€œ¿�highâ€•along with a peculiar sensation in his
stomach (the latter may however be related to his
longstanding somatic delusions), but denied any
other effects. Another (the originator, claiming to
have thought of the procedure himself) found it to
have virtually no effect on him. The third also
found it an unrewarding activity. No changes
were observedin thesepatients'mental statesor
physicalconditionsas a resultof thisparticular
activity.

Neither the hospital pharmacy nor the Regional
Poisons Centre had any information regarding this
phenomenon, and there does not appear to be
any referenceto itin the medicalliterature.The
only otherreportwe have heard emanates from
HM PrisonSaughton(CPN IanWishart,personal
communication).

T. CHALDER

AuThoR's REPLY:Ms Chalderiscorrectinsaying
thatour findingsdo notprovethattheevidenceof
viralinfectiondetectedinoverhalfour sampleof
patientswas closelyconnectedwiththesubsequent
chronic fatigue syndrome. In fact we showed
that CFS patients with and without associated
emotional disorder were biologically similar over a
rangeof viraland immunologicalmeasures.This
confirmedpreviousstudieswhichshowedthatsuch
measures, while they might contribute operationally
toclinicaldefinition,have littlediagnosticvaluein
thispopulationfarlessany establishedetiological
significance. Our reference to â€˜¿�precipitating'viral
infection was meant in the sense of association with
the onset of symptoms, rather than implying aetiol
ogy, which of course could be in either direction.
Counsellingtoremainwithinenergylimitsisnot

logicallyincompatiblewithprogressivediminution
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order (n 103) we demonstrated that the subscale
(FCPCS-PP) has good construct and discriminant
validities and a satisfactory reliability (Loas et al,
1994, 1995).
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When contacted, the manufacturers (Bostik) re
ported that B!u-Tack's constituents could give rise
to glaucoma, lung damage and ultimately death if
abused. In order to determine the constituents
responsible for any psychotropic effect and clarify
the nature of any potential toxicity, we requested an
analysis of Blu-Tack residue from the Department
of Chemistry at the University of Edinburgh.
Electron ionisation mass spectrometry was unhelp
ful, but useful results were obtained from pyrolysis
of a dried sample followed by gas chromatography
separation and further mass spectrometry. A com
plex mixture of hydrocarbons was revealed, whose
principal constituents included butene, heptadiene,
propene, pentene and hexadiene. It may therefore
be presumed that Blu.Tack smoking has attractions
and risks similar to those of inhaling lighter gas, a
common and well-documented phenomenon.

Blu-Tack is fairly readily availablevia art groups,
noticeboards and wall posters even in a locked ward
setting. In view of the above findings and the
consequent possibility of serious risk to the physical
and mental health of those attempting this activity,
we wish to draw attention to it as a novel substance
of abuse.
We wish to thank Professor John Monaghan (Department of
Chemistry, The University of Edinburgh) for his helpful advice,
and Mr W. E. Morden (I.C.I.C. & P. Ltd. Runcorn Heath,
Cheshire) for performing the analysis.
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Scale for assessing hedonic tone
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Neuroleptic associated extrapyramidal symptoms

Sm: It is generally agreed that, according to the
dopamine hypothesis, the antipsychotic effect of
neuroleptics is mediated by blockade of mesolimbic
or mesocortical D2 dopamine receptors whereas the
mechanism by which neuroleptic drugs cause
extrapyramidal side-effects is not yet entirely
understood. It has recently been established that
Parkinson's disease, which is clinically similar to
neuroleptic-induced parkinsonism, is associated
with oxidative damage due to mitochondrial dys
function (Schapira, 1994). A defect of complex I of
the mitochondrial respiratory chain has been re
ported in platelets, muscle and brain tissue of
patients with Parkinson's disease. MPTP (1-methyl
4-phenyl-l,2,3,6-tetrahydropyridine) which may
cause Parkinson's disease, inhibits complex I of the
respiratory chain. It is a substrate for the dopamine
reuptake pathway and is concentrated into mito
chondria. It seemed therefore possible that neuro
leptics might cause extrapyramidal side effects via a
similar mechanism to that of MPTP, especially
sincehaloperidolisstructurallysimilarto MPTP
and may be converted to a halopendol pyridinium
product analogous to MPP@. Further evidence was
derived from studies in rats which showed that
neuroleptics block complex I of the respiratory
chain in vitro (Burkhardt et al, 1993). We therefore

M. WALKER-KINNEAR
T. JoNES

Sm: Snaith et al (1995) have developed a new
pleasure scale (the Snaith Hamilton Pleasure Scale,
SHAPS) corresponding to the need for a simple
scale, not affected by socio-demographical factors
and allowing an easy translation in other languages.
They criticised the existing pleasure scales (Fawcett
Clark Pleasure Capacity Scale or FCPCS;
Chapman's scales) that are too long and presented
cultural bias. Indeed several studies (Loas et a!,
1992) have shown a weak discriminant validity of
the FCPCS in other cultures mainly due to differ
ences in cultural backgrounds and in socio
economic levels. Consequently we have built up
(Loas et al, 1994) a shortened version of the FCPCS
containing 12 items assessing only sensorial and
physical features of pleasure. These items can be
considered as being less sensitive to cultural biases.

In two studies including both healthy subjects
(n 314) and patientswith major depressivedis
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