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Editorial

Development of neuropsychiatry services
worldwide

Arguably Neuropsychiatry is one of the oldest
psychiatric disciplines. It has even been suggested
that psychiatry itself evolved from recognition and
care of patients with neuropsychiatric disorders (1).
Yet, it is ironic that neuropsychiatry is still seen
in the 21st century as an evolving discipline which
is attempting to carve its own identity amongst a
number of established psychiatric subspecialties.

So, what are the hurdles on the path of appropriate
provision of neuropsychiatric services and how can
they be overcome? The problem does not lie in the
recognition of prevalence of neuropsychiatric comor-
bidity in neurological patients, its impact on quality
of life of neurological patients or the burden it places
on patients and their carers. There is consistent
and ever-growing evidence in a number of neuro-
logical conditions and from primary care as well
as specialist settings that highlights the impact of
neuropsychiatric problems on neurological illnesses
and their outcomes (2–4). Need and demand for
neuropsychiatric input have been quantified and ser-
vice models to meet such a need have been proposed
(4). So why is such a vital need still not met?

Divergence of neurology and psychiatry as sep-
arate medical disciplines from the 19th century
onwards has often been blamed for gradually reduc-
ing neuropsychiatric/biological emphasis in psychi-
atric practice. As a consequence, neuropsychiatry is
often misunderstood and has been seen sometimes
as highly esoteric and exotic, something away from
mainstream clinical practice (5). Unfortunately, this
impression still persists despite growing evidence of
neuropsychiatric need. The divergence of the two
disciplines also had an impact on the training that
neurologists received in psychiatry and psychiatrists
in neurology in a number of countries. In addition,
there were shortcomings in neuropsychiatric train-
ing for neurologists and psychiatrists (5). This meant
that the clinicians under-recognised neuropsychiatric
needs and if they did recognise them, they often did
not know how to meet those needs (6).

The review by Arambepola, Rickards and Cavanna
in the present issue looks at the issue of definition of
neuropsychiatry, historical issues including bound-
aries of neurology and psychiatry, evolving roles
of neuropsychiatrists and challenges for future neu-
ropsychiatrists. They highlight the lack of consensus
in defining the discipline and its boundaries, even
though the nature and range of the essential skill set
required by neuropsychiatrists is not in dispute.

Different definitions and interpretations of the core
neuropsychiatric territory could be damaging the
development of essential neuropsychiatric services
globally. This needs to be resolved urgently. While
the peripheral boundaries of neuropsychiatry are
blurred and arguably could shift with time, the core
territory of neuropsychiatry remains relatively stable
and that is where neuropsychiatric services of the
future must focus first.

In their review, Arambepola, Rickards and
Cavanna suggest that there is a clear need for a
specialised field of neuropsychiatry in fulfilling the
complex needs of core neuropsychiatric patients.
They highlight the consequences of the narrow focus
of paradigms of psychiatry and neurology and thus
the need for a broader neuropsychiatric perspective
in a number of patients.

There are existing drivers for the development of
neuropsychiatric services. Psychological, psychiatric
and behavioural needs of patients with neurological
conditions have been recognised in the national
service framework for long-term conditions in the
UK, heralding a shift away from the narrow medical
models of the past (7). National Institute for Clinical
Excellence (NICE) guidelines for a number of
neurological conditions in the UK mention the need
for psychological and neuropsychiatric support (8,9).
While these principles are universally applicable
they often are not emphasised enough in these docu-
ments and recommendations could be more specific
and strong. Greater neuropsychiatric involvement

189

https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1601-5215.2012.00680.x Published online by Cambridge University Press

https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1601-5215.2012.00680.x


Editorial

in development of such guidelines and frameworks,
nationally and internationally, is urgently required.

Development of a neuropsychiatric core curricu-
lum and a well-defined neuropsychiatric training
pathway are essential for the development of neu-
ropsychiatric services worldwide. This has been
achieved successfully in the United States where
there is now a board examination and certification
in neuropsychiatry and behavioural neurology (10).
However, broader neurological training for psychi-
atrists and psychiatric training for neurologists is
equally important as the whole range of neuropsy-
chiatric need cannot be met by specialist neuropsy-
chiatrists. Indeed, it is often suggested that milder
psychological comorbidities in neurological patients,
such as depression, could very well be identified and
treated by neurologists (11).

The challenges in evolution of neuropsychiatric
services also include lack of adequate understand-
ing about neuropsychiatry amongst commissioners
and managers of neurosciences and mental health
services. This is not surprising given differing def-
initions of neuropsychiatry and lack of certainty
about its boundaries. This is combined with the lack
of adequate national and international drivers and
ambiguities in some places about who should ‘own’
neuropsychiatry services (neurosciences or mental
health). Hence, guidelines are urgently needed for
the current and future commissioners and providers
of neuropsychiatric services.

There is evidence of growing interest in neuropsy-
chiatry and anecdotal evidence of growth in neu-
ropsychiatry services worldwide, which is encourag-
ing. An unpublished survey of psychiatric trainees in
the UK conducted by the Section of Neuropsychia-
try of The Royal College of Psychiatrists showed that
over three quarters of trainees wanted training in neu-
ropsychiatry, while looking for a career in the whole
range of psychiatric subspecialties. This energy and
strong interest need to be harnessed.

Despite this, in reality, there remains a wide
gap between current service provision and what

could be considered adequate even for the core
neuropsychiatric territory (4). While the discipline
of neuropsychiatry is described to be in the middle
of a global renaissance, the challenges for adequate
service development remain immense. To usher in a
new era of comprehensive neuropsychiatric care, a
concerted effort is required worldwide.
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