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Editorial

FRANÇOISE BLIN

This first issue of Volume 27 marks a new departure for ReCALL. In her last editorial
(Volume 26, issue 3), June Thompson reflected on the journal’s progress since 2006. The
progress she then outlined is largely due to her tremendous contribution to the journal since
its first issue was published in November 1989. For 25 years, June has managed submis-
sions and their reviews, edited and copy-edited each issue, and worked tirelessly with
authors, reviewers, the Editorial Board, and Cambridge University Press. In particular,
many of us, whether experienced or novice authors, greatly benefited from her careful
editing, which made us better writers and researchers. As this issue is about to go to press,
June is preparing to retire from our editorial team and we wish her well with all her future
plans. She will be greatly missed, and following in her footsteps is no easy task.
Indeed, with an average of 100 submissions per year, we have had to re-organise our

editorial processes to meet the new challenges facing us. Following an intermediary chan-
geover phase, we now have a new journal administrator, Sylvie Thouësny, who has been
instrumental in helping us move to an online submission system. This will help us process
the articles we receive faster and more efficiently. Our pool of actual or potential reviewers
is also steadily increasing, and we are delighted that many authors and colleagues from all
around the world are now reviewing submissions. Reviewing for a journal such as ReCALL
is a time consuming activity that usually remains invisible, and brings few rewards. Yet
blind peer-reviewing is a fundamental principle governing scientific publication today. Our
reviewers have played, and continue to play, an essential role in ensuring that ReCALL
remains one of the top CALL journals as evidenced by our latest impact factor and rankings
in ISI and Scopus. Our warmest thanks to all of you!

* * * * * * *

This issue comprises five regular papers and one selected paper from the EUROCALL 2013
conference held in Évora, Portugal. In the first article, Jack Burston provides a critical
analysis of published MALL studies. The shortcomings of MALL research to date are
highlighted and include poor research design and the paucity of statistically reliable data.
David Neville then reports on a mixed-methods study that evaluates the use of such an
environment designed to teach German two-way prepositions and specialised vocabulary in
the area of recycling and waste management systems. Drawing on the concept of goal-
directed activity systems, Neville explores how language learners immersed in a 3D gaming
environment configure digital narratives and story maps to structure written L2 narratives
that describe their imagined personal experience. Continuing with digital game-based
learning, Hayo Reinders and Sorada Wattana investigate students’ experience in the context
of a game-based learning programme at a Thai university and focus more particularly on the
impact of gameplay on their willingness to communicate in English. The next two articles
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report on the development and evaluation of systems developed by the authors with a view
to enhancing EFL learners’ pronunciation and listening comprehension skills respectively.
Hiroshi Kibishi, Kuniaki Hirabayashi, and Seiichi Nakagawa propose a statistical method
for estimating the pronunciation and intelligibility scores of Japanese speakers of English,
using an online real-time score estimation system developed by the authors. Ching-Kun Hsu
reports on the development and evaluation of an adaptive video caption filtering system for
mobile devices designed to support the development of listening skills in EFL among
Taiwanese learners, with a particular focus on learning motivation, satisfaction, and
enjoyment. The sixth and final article, by Fiona Farr and Elaine Riordan, expands on their
presentation at the EUROCALL 2013 conference. Adopting a mixed-methods approach
using a position survey as well as corpus linguistics techniques, the authors examine
communication technologies in terms of their suitability and affordances as reflective media
in a language teacher education context.

* * * * * * *
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