
Correspondence 
More on Rogers v. Okin 

Dear Editors: 
The article by Mark J. Mills in the 

April issue Of MEDICOLECAL NEWS, 
The Continuing Clinicolegal Conun- 
drum of the Boston State Hospital 
Case, is an excellent review of the 
troublesome case, Rogers v. Okin. 
However, Dr. Mills repeats a psychiat- 
ric cliche that does not withstand close 
scrutiny: "Denial [of mental illness] is 
one of the hallmarks of psychiatric dis- 
turbance. . . ." In considering that 
statement, one should recognize that 
denial is also a hallmark of sanity! 

trists, social workers, alcohol treat- 
ment counselors, and the like: they tout 
"denial" as confirming their diagnoses, 
whereas in fact it is diagnostic of abso- 
lutely nothing. 

Dr. Mills and his contemporaries 
would do themselves a favor if they 
would forget the trite argument about 
denial and get down to substance. 

This is a common error of psychia- 

J. Stuart Showalter, J.D., M.F.S. 
Chesterfield, Missouri 

h. Mills responds: 
Although I may have overstated 

the case when I used the word 
"hallmarks," denial is a frequent man- 
ifestation of psychosis (paranoia in par- 
ticular) and a sometime defense to 
psychologic and physical trauma. 
I question whether "denial" is a 
hallmark of sanity (but note that since 
my observations were clinical, and 
since sanity is a legal term, it is difficult 
to comment precisely). 

Upon reconsidering my article in 
my new role as Commissioner of Men- 
tal Health for Massachusetts, I am in- 
creasingly troubled by the Court of Ap- 
peals opinion in Rogers Y. Okin. What 
distresses me is that the court engages 
in policy-making without an adequate 
constitutional foundation, and that 
the judicially-promulgated policy is 
too rigid in its imposition on clinical 
decision-makers. I believe it should 
not stand and have thus welcomed 
the Commonwealth's appeal to the 
Supreme Court,which has granted 
certioruri. 

In re Spring 
Dear Editors: 

1 write to applaud Dr. Cranford's 
editorial in the February 1981 edition 
of MEDICOLEGAL N t w s  concerning 
the importance of interdisciplinary 
dialogue, and to comment upon the 
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DundAtor article, Vox Clamantis in 
Deserto: Do You Really Mean What 
You Say in Spring? 

Attorney Dunn's brief as amicus 
curiae for the Illinois Association of 
Hospital Attorneys in the Spring' case 
provided the Supreme Judicial Court 
of Massachusetts, in my view, a com- 
prehensive statement of the issues and 
an exacting survey of the state of the 
law. His contribution to the discus- 
sion of these troubling issues is to be 
commended. 

When I was appointed Guardian 
ad litem for Earle N. Spring, the only 
source of guidance available to me was 
the Saikewicz case and its substituted 
judgment test.z Forexample, was the 
Guardian ad litem an investigator for 
the court or an advocate within the 
adversary system for the ward? 

During the judicial proceedings, 
I was concerned about whether there 
was sufficient evidence for the court to 
determine, utilizing the substituted 
judgment criteria of Saikewicz, wheth- 
er it was Mr. Spring's wish to terminate 
this treatment. The Probate Court held 
that there was sufficient evidence for 
such a finding, and the Appeals Court, 
in affirming the lower court, deter- 
mined that the Probate Court's review 
of the evidence was not clearly errone- 
ous. The Supreme Judicial Court did 
not disturb that portion of the Appeals 
Court's opinion. 

Prior to the rehearing, scheduled 
pursuant to Justice Quirico's order of 
February 4,1980, I presented to the 
Probate Court a motion for the court to 
consider adopting a higher standard of 
proof than previously applied. In an- 
swering Justice Quirico's question, 1 
suggested that the Probate Court adopt 
a clear and convincing test or the rea- 
sonable doubt standard. See attached 
motion. 

I note that in Eichner v. Dillon, the 
New York Court of Appeals held that 
Brother Fox should be allowed to die 
since the "evidence clearly and con- 
vincingly showed that Brother Fox did 
not want to be maintained in a vegeta- 
tive coma by use of a respirator."' I 
suggest that the John Storar decision 
similarly supports the argument that 
there must be a clear demonstration of 
an individual's competent desires in 
connection with these  matter^.^ 

On April 23, 1981, the Supreme 
Judicial Court answered the questions 
raised by my motion as to the appro- 
priate standard of proof to be applied in 
guardianship proceedings. In the mat- 
ter of the Guardianship of Richard Roe 
111,s the court held that the requisite 

standard of proof for the appointment 
of a guardian for an "individual unable 
to care for himself by reason of mental 
illness" is the usual preponderance of 
the evidence standard used in civil 
proceedings. 

In Roe I I I ,  I represented the guard- 
ian who sought certain standby author- 
ity to administer psychotropic drugs 
to a non-institutionalized incompetent 
ward. In this regard, the SJC held that 
the likelihood of serious harm to the 
public must be established beyond a 
reasonable doubt for the court to au- 
thorize an order for forced medication. 

The court again relied upon the 
substituted judgment test to determine 
whether this type of treatment modality 
was to be utilized. In doing so, in my 
view, the court replied to Mr. Dunn's 
and Ms. Ator's concerns that the court 
had not provided the bar and the medi- 
cal profession with sufficient guidelines 
for future cases. The SJC's lengthy 
opinion now provides that guidance. 
Although the court repeatedly stated 
that its opinion was limited to an in- 
competent individual who is not in- 
stitutionalized and who has a guardian 
who is seeking to administer certain 
psychotropic medications, I suggest 
that the court in Roe I l l  has clarified 
the Spring case. 

The guidelines, as enumerated by 
the court are as  follows: First, the need 
for a court order. The court once again 
stated its preference for the judicial 
forum for such decisions, and held that 
the question is not whether the treat- 
ment is in the wards best medical 
interest, but what the individual would 
have done if competent. In answering 
this question, the court must look to 
the intrusiveness of the proposed 
treatment, the possibility of side ef- 
fects, the absence of an emergency, the 
nature and extent of prior judicial in- 
volvement, and the likelihood of con- 
flicting interests. Second, the court de- 
lineated the relevant factors in making 
a substituted judgment determination 
-factors not expressed in the Spring 
case. They are: (1) the ward's ex- 
pressed preference regarding treat- 
ment, (2 )  his religious beliefs, (3) the 
impact on the ward's family, (4) the 
probability of adverse side effects, 
( 5 )  the consequence if treatment is re- 
fused, and (6) the prognosis with treat- 
ment. These six factors are now to be 
utilized in determining, as best as  we 
are able, what the incompetent indi- 
vidual would have decided if he or she 
were competent to decide. 
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